
Eighth Sunday after Pentecost  August 4, 2019 
 
FIRST LESSON        Ecclesiastes 1:2, 12-14; 2:18-26 

Vanity of vanities, says the Preacher, vanity of vanities! All is vanity. 

I the Preacher have been king over Israel in Jerusalem. And I applied my heart to seek and to search out by 
wisdom all that is done under heaven. It is an unhappy business that God has given to the children of man to 
be busy with. I have seen everything that is done under the sun, and behold, all is vanity and a striving after 
wind. 

I hated all my toil in which I toil under the sun, seeing that I must leave it to the man who will come after me, 
and who knows whether he will be wise or a fool? Yet he will be master of all for which I toiled and used my 
wisdom under the sun. This also is vanity. So I turned about and gave my heart up to despair over all the toil of 
my labors under the sun, because sometimes a person who has toiled with wisdom and knowledge and skill 
must leave everything to be enjoyed by someone who did not toil for it. This also is vanity and a great evil. 
What has a man from all the toil and striving of heart with which he toils beneath the sun? For all his days are 
full of sorrow, and his work is a vexation. Even in the night his heart does not rest. This also is vanity. 

There is nothing better for a person than that he should eat and drink and find enjoyment in his toil. This also, I 
saw, is from the hand of God, for apart from him who can eat or who can have enjoyment? For to the one who 
pleases him God has given wisdom and knowledge and joy, but to the sinner he has given the business of 
gathering and collecting, only to give to one who pleases God. This also is vanity and a striving after wind. 
 
 
EPISTLE           Colossians 3:1-11 

If then you have been raised with Christ, seek the things that are above, where Christ is, seated at the right 
hand of God. Set your minds on things that are above, not on things that are on earth. For you have died, and 
your life is hidden with Christ in God. When Christ who is your life appears, then you also will appear with him 
in glory. 

Put to death therefore what is earthly in you: sexual immorality, impurity, passion, evil desire, and 
covetousness, which is idolatry. On account of these the wrath of God is coming. In these you too once 
walked, when you were living in them. But now you must put them all away: anger, wrath, malice, slander, and 
obscene talk from your mouth. Do not lie to one another, seeing that you have put off the old self with its 
practices and have put on the new self, which is being renewed in knowledge after the image of its creator. 
Here there is not Greek and Jew, circumcised and uncircumcised, barbarian, Scythian, slave, free; but Christ is 
all, and in all. 
 
 
HOLY GOSPEL           Luke 12:13-21 

Someone in the crowd said to him, “Teacher, tell my brother to divide the inheritance with me.” But he said to 
him, “Man, who made me a judge or arbitrator over you?” And he said to them, “Take care, and be on your 
guard against all covetousness, for one's life does not consist in the abundance of his possessions.” And he 
told them a parable, saying, “The land of a rich man produced plentifully, and he thought to himself, ‘What shall 
I do, for I have nowhere to store my crops?’ And he said, ‘I will do this: I will tear down my barns and build 
larger ones, and there I will store all my grain and my goods. And I will say to my soul, “Soul, you have ample 
goods laid up for many years; relax, eat, drink, be merry.”’ But God said to him, ‘Fool! This night your soul is 
required of you, and the things you have prepared, whose will they be?’ So is the one who lays up treasure for 
himself and is not rich toward God.” 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Ninth Sunday after Pentecost  August 11, 2019 
 
FIRST LESSON          Genesis 15:1-6 

After these things the word of the Lord came to Abram in a vision: “Fear not, Abram, I am your shield; your 
reward shall be very great.” But Abram said, “O Lord God, what will you give me, for I continue childless, and 
the heir of my house is Eliezer of Damascus?” And Abram said, “Behold, you have given me no offspring, and 
a member of my household will be my heir.” And behold, the word of the Lord came to him: “This man shall not 
be your heir; your very own son shall be your heir.” And he brought him outside and said, “Look toward 
heaven, and number the stars, if you are able to number them.” Then he said to him, “So shall your offspring 
be.” And he believed the Lord, and he counted it to him as righteousness. 

 
EPISTLE           Hebrews 11:1-16 

Now faith is the assurance of things hoped for, the conviction of things not seen. For by it the people of old 
received their commendation. By faith we understand that the universe was created by the word of God, so 
that what is seen was not made out of things that are visible. 

By faith Abel offered to God a more acceptable sacrifice than Cain, through which he was commended as 
righteous, God commending him by accepting his gifts. And through his faith, though he died, he still speaks. 
By faith Enoch was taken up so that he should not see death, and he was not found, because God had taken 
him. Now before he was taken he was commended as having pleased God. And without faith it is impossible to 
please him, for whoever would draw near to God must believe that he exists and that he rewards those who 
seek him. By faith Noah, being warned by God concerning events as yet unseen, in reverent fear constructed 
an ark for the saving of his household. By this he condemned the world and became an heir of the 
righteousness that comes by faith. 

By faith Abraham obeyed when he was called to go out to a place that he was to receive as an inheritance. 
And he went out, not knowing where he was going. By faith he went to live in the land of promise, as in a 
foreign land, living in tents with Isaac and Jacob, heirs with him of the same promise. For he was looking 
forward to the city that has foundations, whose designer and builder is God. By faith Sarah herself received 
power to conceive, even when she was past the age, since she considered him faithful who had promised. 
Therefore from one man, and him as good as dead, were born descendants as many as the stars of heaven 
and as many as the innumerable grains of sand by the seashore. 

These all died in faith, not having received the things promised, but having seen them and greeted them from 
afar, and having acknowledged that they were strangers and exiles on the earth. For people who speak thus 
make it clear that they are seeking a homeland. If they had been thinking of that land from which they had 
gone out, they would have had opportunity to return. But as it is, they desire a better country, that is, a 
heavenly one. Therefore God is not ashamed to be called their God, for he has prepared for them a city. 
 
 
HOLY GOSPEL           Luke 12:22-34 

And he said to his disciples, “Therefore I tell you, do not be anxious about your life, what you will eat, nor about 
your body, what you will put on. For life is more than food, and the body more than clothing. Consider the 
ravens: they neither sow nor reap, they have neither storehouse nor barn, and yet God feeds them. Of how 
much more value are you than the birds! And which of you by being anxious can add a single hour to his span 
of life? If then you are not able to do as small a thing as that, why are you anxious about the rest? Consider the 
lilies, how they grow: they neither toil nor spin, yet I tell you, even Solomon in all his glory was not arrayed like 
one of these. But if God so clothes the grass, which is alive in the field today, and tomorrow is thrown into the 
oven, how much more will he clothe you, O you of little faith! And do not seek what you are to eat and what you 
are to drink, nor be worried. For all the nations of the world seek after these things, and your Father knows that 
you need them. Instead, seek his kingdom, and these things will be added to you. 

“Fear not, little flock, for it is your Father's good pleasure to give you the kingdom. Sell your possessions, and 
give to the needy. Provide yourselves with moneybags that do not grow old, with a treasure in the heavens that 
does not fail, where no thief approaches and no moth destroys. For where your treasure is, there will your 
heart be also. 
 



Tenth Sunday after Pentecost  August 18, 2019 
 
FIRST LESSON          Jeremiah 23:16-29 

Thus says the Lord of hosts: “Do not listen to the words of the prophets who prophesy to you, filling you with 
vain hopes. They speak visions of their own minds, not from the mouth of the Lord. They say continually to 
those who despise the word of the Lord, ‘It shall be well with you’; and to everyone who stubbornly follows his 
own heart, they say, ‘No disaster shall come upon you.’” 

For who among them has stood in the council of the Lord to see and to hear his word, 
    or who has paid attention to his word and listened? 
Behold, the storm of the Lord! Wrath has gone forth, a whirling tempest; 
    it will burst upon the head of the wicked. 
The anger of the Lord will not turn back until he has executed and accomplished the intents of his heart. 
In the latter days you will understand it clearly. 
“I did not send the prophets, yet they ran; I did not speak to them, yet they prophesied. 
But if they had stood in my council, then they would have proclaimed my words to my people, 
and they would have turned them from their evil way, and from the evil of their deeds. 

“Am I a God at hand, declares the Lord, and not a God far away? Can a man hide himself in secret places so 
that I cannot see him? declares the Lord. Do I not fill heaven and earth? declares the Lord. I have heard what 
the prophets have said who prophesy lies in my name, saying, ‘I have dreamed, I have dreamed!’ How long 
shall there be lies in the heart of the prophets who prophesy lies, and who prophesy the deceit of their own 
heart, who think to make my people forget my name by their dreams that they tell one another, even as their 
fathers forgot my name for Baal? Let the prophet who has a dream tell the dream, but let him who has my word 
speak my word faithfully. What has straw in common with wheat? declares the Lord. Is not my word like fire, 
declares the Lord, and like a hammer that breaks the rock in pieces? 
 
 
 
EPISTLE          Hebrews 11:17-31; 12:1-3 

By faith Abraham, when he was tested, offered up Isaac, and he who had received the promises was in the act 
of offering up his only son, of whom it was said, “Through Isaac shall your offspring be named.” He considered 
that God was able even to raise him from the dead, from which, figuratively speaking, he did receive him back. 
By faith Isaac invoked future blessings on Jacob and Esau. By faith Jacob, when dying, blessed each of the 
sons of Joseph, bowing in worship over the head of his staff. By faith Joseph, at the end of his life, made 
mention of the exodus of the Israelites and gave directions concerning his bones. 

By faith Moses, when he was born, was hidden for three months by his parents, because they saw that the 
child was beautiful, and they were not afraid of the king's edict. By faith Moses, when he was grown up, 
refused to be called the son of Pharaoh's daughter, choosing rather to be mistreated with the people of God 
than to enjoy the fleeting pleasures of sin. He considered the reproach of Christ greater wealth than the 
treasures of Egypt, for he was looking to the reward. By faith he left Egypt, not being afraid of the anger of the 
king, for he endured as seeing him who is invisible. By faith he kept the Passover and sprinkled the blood, so 
that the Destroyer of the firstborn might not touch them. 

By faith the people crossed the Red Sea as on dry land, but the Egyptians, when they attempted to do the 
same, were drowned. By faith the walls of Jericho fell down after they had been encircled for seven days. By 
faith Rahab the prostitute did not perish with those who were disobedient, because she had given a friendly 
welcome to the spies. 

Therefore, since we are surrounded by so great a cloud of witnesses, let us also lay aside every weight, and 
sin which clings so closely, and let us run with endurance the race that is set before us, looking to Jesus, the 
founder and perfecter of our faith, who for the joy that was set before him endured the cross, despising the 
shame, and is seated at the right hand of the throne of God. 

Consider him who endured from sinners such hostility against himself, so that you may not grow weary or 
fainthearted. 
 
 



HOLY GOSPEL           Luke 12:49-53 

“I came to cast fire on the earth, and would that it were already kindled! I have a baptism to be baptized with, 
and how great is my distress until it is accomplished! Do you think that I have come to give peace on 
earth? No, I tell you, but rather division. For from now on in one house there will be five divided, three against 
two and two against three. They will be divided, father against son and son against father, mother against 
daughter and daughter against mother, mother-in-law against her daughter-in-law and daughter-in-law against 
mother-in-law.” 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Eleventh Sunday after Pentecost  August 25, 2019 
 
FIRST LESSON          Isaiah 66:18-23 

“For I know their works and their thoughts, and the time is coming to gather all nations and tongues. And they 
shall come and shall see my glory, and I will set a sign among them. And from them I will send survivors to the 
nations, to Tarshish, Pul, and Lud, who draw the bow, to Tubal and Javan, to the coastlands far away, that 
have not heard my fame or seen my glory. And they shall declare my glory among the nations. And they shall 
bring all your brothers from all the nations as an offering to the Lord, on horses and in chariots and in litters 
and on mules and on dromedaries, to my holy mountain Jerusalem, says the Lord, just as the Israelites bring 
their grain offering in a clean vessel to the house of the Lord. And some of them also I will take for priests and 
for Levites, says the Lord. 

“For as the new heavens and the new earth 
    that I make shall remain before me, says the Lord, 
    so shall your offspring and your name remain. 
From new moon to new moon, and from Sabbath to Sabbath, 
all flesh shall come to worship before me, declares the Lord. 
 

 
EPISTLE           Hebrews 12:4-24 

In your struggle against sin you have not yet resisted to the point of shedding your blood. And have you 
forgotten the exhortation that addresses you as sons? 
 

“My son, do not regard lightly the discipline of the Lord, nor be weary when reproved by him. 
For the Lord disciplines the one he loves, and chastises every son whom he receives.” 

It is for discipline that you have to endure. God is treating you as sons. For what son is there whom his father 
does not discipline? If you are left without discipline, in which all have participated, then you are illegitimate 
children and not sons. Besides this, we have had earthly fathers who disciplined us and we respected them. 
Shall we not much more be subject to the Father of spirits and live? For they disciplined us for a short time as it 
seemed best to them, but he disciplines us for our good, that we may share his holiness. For the moment all 
discipline seems painful rather than pleasant, but later it yields the peaceful fruit of righteousness to those who 
have been trained by it. 

Therefore lift your drooping hands and strengthen your weak knees, and make straight paths for your feet, so 
that what is lame may not be put out of joint but rather be healed. Strive for peace with everyone, and for the 
holiness without which no one will see the Lord. See to it that no one fails to obtain the grace of God; that no 
“root of bitterness” springs up and causes trouble, and by it many become defiled; that no one is sexually 
immoral or unholy like Esau, who sold his birthright for a single meal. For you know that afterward, when he 
desired to inherit the blessing, he was rejected, for he found no chance to repent, though he sought it with 
tears. 

For you have not come to what may be touched, a blazing fire and darkness and gloom and a tempest and the 
sound of a trumpet and a voice whose words made the hearers beg that no further messages be spoken to 
them. For they could not endure the order that was given, “If even a beast touches the mountain, it shall be 
stoned.” Indeed, so terrifying was the sight that Moses said, “I tremble with fear.” But you have come to Mount 
Zion and to the city of the living God, the heavenly Jerusalem, and to innumerable angels in festal gathering, 
and to the assembly of the firstborn who are enrolled in heaven, and to God, the judge of all, and to the spirits 
of the righteous made perfect, and to Jesus, the mediator of a new covenant, and to the sprinkled blood that 
speaks a better word than the blood of Abel. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



HOLY GOSPEL           Luke 13:22-30 

He went on his way through towns and villages, teaching and journeying toward Jerusalem. And someone said 
to him, “Lord, will those who are saved be few?” And he said to them, “Strive to enter through the narrow door. 
For many, I tell you, will seek to enter and will not be able. When once the master of the house has risen and 
shut the door, and you begin to stand outside and to knock at the door, saying, ‘Lord, open to us,’ then he will 
answer you, ‘I do not know where you come from.’ Then you will begin to say, ‘We ate and drank in your 
presence, and you taught in our streets.’ But he will say, ‘I tell you, I do not know where you come from. Depart 
from me, all you workers of evil!’ In that place there will be weeping and gnashing of teeth, when you see 
Abraham and Isaac and Jacob and all the prophets in the kingdom of God but you yourselves cast out. And 
people will come from east and west, and from north and south, and recline at table in the kingdom of God. 
And behold, some are last who will be first, and some are first who will be last.” 
 


